Neal A. Puckett, Esq. Lic: VA

Haytham Faraj, Esq. Lic: DC, IL & MI



THE LAW FIRM OF PUCKETT AND FARAJ, PC

June 6, 2010

GoodFellas % Wissam Aoun 18334 W. Warren Ave Detroit, MI 48228

Re: GoodFellas v Macy's

Dear Mr. Aoun,

Attached is a billing statement for current expenses due on your account. Your fee agreement indicates a \$50.00 hour fee for paralegal work and expenses for the case including travel of the attorney. The balance due on your account is \$1,435.00. Please send a check or money order payable to "The Law Firm of Puckett & Faraj, PC," to 2181 Jamieson Ave, Suite 1505, Alexandria, VA 22314

I can be reached Monday through Friday from 9:00 AM to 5:00 PM Eastern Standard Time via Email at marcy@puckettfaraj.com or on our toll free line 888.970.0005, Ext 1. Thank you.

Sincerely yours,

Mardelyn Atwood Business Manager

Puckett & Farai, PC.

Enclosure

Inv dtd 5/1/10 Inv dtd 6/1/10

ea di

Date 05/01/10

Invoice

Puckett & Faraj

The Law Firm of Puckett & Faraj, PC 2181 Jamieson Ave, Suite 1505 Alexandria, VA 22314

Goodfellas
Attn: Wissam Aoun
18334 W. Warren Ave
Detroit, MI 48228

Serviced	Description	Quantity	Raite	Amount
04/19/10	Discuss Motion w/Faraj, Research Summary Judgement Rules	0.7	50.00	35.00
04/22/10	Review Documents; Draft Opposition to Motion; Discuss w/Faraj	1.9	50.00	95.00
04/27/10	Discuss Motion w/Haytham; Discuss case with Client	0.5	50.00	25.00
04/28/10 04/29/10	Respond to Email from Client Re: Documents Review Documents, Court Rules, Deadlines; Draft Opposition Motion, Email w/Client	0.1	50.00 50.00	5.00 150.00

Make Check or Money Order out to: "The Law Firm of Puckett & Faraj, PC." Mail to: 2181 Jamieson Ave, Suite 1505, Alexandria, VA 22314

Total	\$310.00

Payments/Credit \$0.00

Balance Due	\$310.00
Dalance Due	φ3 10.00

Date 06/01/10

Invoice

Puckett & Faraj

The Law Firm of Puckett & Faraj, PC 2181 Jamieson Ave, Suite 1505 Alexandria, VA 22314

Goodfellas Attn: Wissam Aoun 18334 W. Warren Ave

Detroit, MI 48228

Serviced	Descriptions	Quantity	Rate	Amount
05/15/10	Telecon w/Faraj, Re: Case and Documents	0.3	50.00	15.00
05/17/10	Review Documents	3.4	50.00	170.00
05/18/10	Review Documents, Draft Motion, Research Tort	4.2	50.00	210.00
05/19/10	Elements, Discuss w/Faraj Draft Motion, Discuss w/Client & Faraj	7.4	FO 00	270.00
05/22/10	Discuss w/Faraj	0.2	50.00 50.00	370.00 10.00
05/24/10	Research Extension of Discovery	1.8		90.00
05/26/10	Discuss w/Faraj	0.1	50.00	5.00
05/31/10	Discuss Opposition Motion w/Faraj: Review and	5.1	50.00	255.00
	Revise Motion			

Make Check or Money Order out to: "The Law Firm of Puckett & Faraj, PC." Mail to: 2181 Jamieson Ave, Suite 1505, Alexandria, VA 22314

Total \$1,125.00

Payments/Credit \$0.00

Balance Due \$1,125.00

