Neal Puckett, Esq.

Lic. VA qF‘

Haytham Faraj, Esq. .
Lic. IL, ML, DC Puckett & Faraj

THE LAW FIRM OF PUCKETT AND FARALJ, PC

October 27, 2010

Yia First Class Mail

Judge Nancy Edmunds

Attn: Ms. Carol Hemeyer

United States District Court

For the Eastern District of Michigan
231 W. Lafayette Blvd., Room 211
Detroit, MI 48226

Appointed attorney budget in U.S. v. Hamama; 2:08-CR-20314; Interim Budget 03
Dear Ms. Hemeyer:

Attached are my voucher, lime sheets, expenses and receipt for the period of May 29,
2010 to October 25, 2010.

Thank you for your assistance.

P72581

P.O. Box 1016 ¢ DEARBORN HEIGHTS, MICHIGAN » 48127
PHONE ¢ 313.457.1390 « Fax 202.280.1039
WWW.PUCKETTFARA).COM



EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN
STAGE 1 MEGA CASE (PRE-TRIAL)
CASE MANAGEMENT AND BUDGET FORMS

To set up a case, please complete the following information:

Case Number: | 2:08-CR-20314 | Case Name: | USA v. Hamama |
Defendant: | Issam George Hamama |
Lead Attorney Associate

Full Name: |Haytham l?araj
Address: [1800 Diagonal Road
Suite 210
City, State, ZIP: [Alexandria, Virginia 22314
Phone: [313-4577-1390
E-mail: Jhaytham@puckettfaraj.com

’[
|

|

Rate/Hour: $125.00

Budget period beginning [ 5/29/2010]
andending [~ 10/27/2010]

Header Page



EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN
STAGE 1 MEGA CASE (PRE-TRIAL)

CASE MANGEMENT AND BUDGET FORMS
(Excludes Travel Time)

Case Number:  2:08-CR-20314
Case Name:  USA v. Hamama
Lead Counsel: = Haytham Faraj
Budget period beginning  5/29/2010 and ending  10/27/2010
Hours for Lead Counsel | Hours for Associate Total Cost

Activities Proposed Approved Proposed Approved Proposed Approved

Arraignment and or Plea (15a) - -

Bail and Detention Hearings (15b) - -
Motion Hearings (15c¢) 32.0 32.0 4,000.00 4,000.00

Trial (15d) . -

Sentencing Hearings (15€) . .

Revocation Hearings (15f) - -

Appeals Court (15g) - -
|Other (15h) 5.0 5.0 625.00 625.00
llnterviews and Conferences (16a) 60.0 60.0 7,500.00 7,500.00
IObtaining and Reviewing Records (16b) 60.0 60.0 7.500.00 7,500.00
IL_egaI Research and Brief Writing (16c) 80.0 80.0 10,000.00 10,000.00
Investigative and Other Work (16e) 40.0 40.0 5,000.00 5,000.00
Amendments to Budget (16e) 2.0 2.0 250.00 250.00
Totals 279.0 279.0 - - 34,875.00 |  34,875.00

Total (non-travel) expenses incurred and/or anticipated for this phase (e.g. copying, postage, telephone/fax):

Proposed:

Approved:

1,000.00

1,000.00

Stage 1 Time Budget



EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN
STAGE 1 MEGA CASE (PRE-TRIAL)

CASE MANAGEMENT AND BUDGET FORM--TRAVEL ONLY

Case Number:  2:08-CR-20314
Case Name: USA v. Hamama
Lead Counsel: = Haytham Faraj
Hours Required for Travel (16d) (}-lr:t‘:: 3::::0 Total Travel Cost
Proposed Approved transportation, etc.)
h- ] v g

Activities Description and Purpose of Travel 8 § 4 § Propased | Approved |  Proposed Approved

Arraignment and or Plea (15a) - -

iBaiI and Detention Hearings (15b) - -
I;Vlotion Hearings (15¢) 4 round trips to court 4.0 4.0 57.2 57.2 557.20 §57.20

Trial {15d) . -

[Sentencing Hearings (15€) - -

Iglocation Hearings (15f) - -

Appeals Court (15g) - -
Other (15h) travel to meet with experts 5.0 5.0 400.0 400.0 1,025.00 1,025.00
linterviews and Conferences (16a) travel to meet with prosecutors 6.0 6.0 85.8 85.8 835.80 835.80

Obtaining and Reviewing Records (16b} . -

jLegal Research and Brief Writing (16¢) - -
Investigative and Other Work (16s) Jtravel to meet with witnesses in Michigan and Alabama 20.0 20.0 230.0 230.0 2,730.00 2,730.00
Amendments to Budget (16e) 1.0 1.0 125.00 125.00
Totals 36.0 36.0 - 773.0 773.0] 5,273.00 | 5,273.00

Stage 1 Travel Budget



EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN
STAGE 1 MEGA CASE (PRE-TRIAL)
INVESTIGATORS, EXPERTS & OTHER SERVICES REQUEST FORM & BUDGET

Name of | HOURLY RATE J.zcgwm: OF HOURS # OF TRAVEL HOURS H><m_. EXPENSES _ TOTAL BUDGET
EXPERT TYPE Expert Proposed | Approved | Proposed | Approved | Proposed | Approved | Proposed | Approved Proposod Approved
e T T RIS (U XTI TTT T WOy CTeee
Other (Specify) and culturo 150.00 150.00 30.0 30.0 20.0 20.0 2,500.00 2,500.00 10,000.00 10,000.00
fama_‘ma_.: ranslator Mang Khatd 50.00 50.00 160.0 160.0 2.0 20 8.100.00 8.100.00
— Co: at:on 00 COmpany tha!

Other (Specify) dovolops d j its using 100.00 100.00 70.0 70.0 7.000.060 7.000.00

TOTALS 260.0 260.0 22.0 22.0] 2,500.00| 2,500.00]| 25,100.00| 25,100.00

Expert/investigators




EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN

ATTORNEY TIME SHEET
Case Number:  2:08-CR-20314 Note: Before Entering or Importing Data,
Case Name: USAv. Hamama Select Role in Case------>

Counsel:

Budgot period beginning  5/29/2010 ending 10/27/2010

Review of Ilinois District Court order

5/29/2010 _|and AL-Dani testimony 2.0 2.0
Review of Al-Dani testimony and
5/31/2010 |motions 4.0 4.0

Prepare for motions hearing, travel
to and from hearing, and confernce
with FBI agent and AUSA Martin;

6/1/2010 |update time sheet 1.5 1.3 2.5 1.0 6.3
Met with client discussed witness

6/2/2010  |testimony 2.0 1.0 3.0
Discuss findings of facts-Review

6/2/2010  [Documents 0.5 0.5
Review Docs/ Draft Proposed

6/3/2010 __|Findings of Fact 3.3 3.3
Draft Proposed Findings of

6/4/2010  |Fact/Review Docs 2.0 20

6/5/2010  |Review Docs 0.3 0.3

6/7/2010  |Review Docs 4.6 4.6

6/8/2010  |Review Docs 2.3 23
email to Suzanne Jacque re:

6/11/2010 |transcripts; Reviewed transcript 0.6 0.6

Consulted on proposed Findings of
Fact, Review Court Transcripts; Draft
6//11/2010 |Proposed Findings of Fact 1.6

Research; Draft Proposed Findings
6/14/2010 Jof Fact 4.1 4.1

6/21/2010 |Edit Draft of Proposed Findings; 0.5 Attorndy Timasheby 05 |




{|T6tal Hours:Leftto.Use
Edited Proposed FOF and
6/23/2010 |Conclusions 0.7 0.7
6/23/2010 |Edit Findings, 0.3 0.3
Prepred motion for leave to submit
evidence. Prepared proffer of
evidence. Prepared documents for
submission; confrred with
6/25/2010 [Prosecutor. 2.5 2.5
Discuss Case, Prep of Wintesses //
Review Plea Agreement // Legal
6/25/2010 |Research 0.9 0.9
Reviewed researched and prepared
7/13/2010  |jury instructions 0.5 0.5
7/13/2010 |Witness List/Jury Instructions 0.1 0.1
7/14/2010 |Draft Jury Instructions & Witness List 2.2 2.2
7/15/2010 |Edit Jury Instructions 1.9 1.9
7/16/2010 |PTC with Judge to discuss trial dates 0.1 0.1
9/12/2010 {Reviewed government discovery 6.0 6.0
Contacted witnesses to follow up on
9/14/2010 |addresses 0.8 08
Prepared motion, order and out of
10/13/2010 |district subpoena for James Oliver 2.0 2.0
10/14/2010 |Prepared for focus group 1.0 1.0
10/25/2010 |Conducted focus group 3.5 1.5 5.0
10/26/2010 |Prepared time and expense sheet 15 15
10/27.2010 |Prepared time and expense sheet 1.0 1.0
‘Totals - - 15 - - - - 8.3 4.6 4.0 30.3 9.4 - 35 61.6

Attorney Timesheet



EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN
STAGE 1 MEGA CASE (PRE-TRIAL)
ATTORNEY REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES

Case Number: 2:08-CR-20314

Case Name: USA v. Hamama

Counsel:

[ Date: pen
5/29/2010|Staples 39.81
6/1/2010|Parking- motions hearing 18.00
6/29/2010]Office Supplies- Costco 51.16
9/22/2010{Payment to Dr. Al-Marashi for expert consulting 2,040.00
Totals - 2,148.97

Attorney Expenses



CJA 20 (Eloctionic Form) APPOINTMENT OF AND AUTHORITY TO PAY COURT APPOINTED COUNSEL (Rev. 12/03)

1. CIR/DIST/ DiV. CODE 2. PERSON REPRESENTED VOUCHER NUMBER
Issam George Hamama
|5 VAG DRT/DOEF. NUMBER | —BBTD'RT?D'EF'NUMEER__:;. . : 3. APPEALS DKTJ DEF. NUNBER 6. OYHER DKT. NUMBER |
2:08-CR-20314
7. IN CASE/MATTER OF (Caso Name) 8. PAYMENT CATEGORY |o. TYPE PERSON REPRESENTED 10. REPRESENTATION TYPE
USA v. Hamama

10. OFFENSE(S) CHARGED (Cite U.S. Code, Title & Section) ¥f more than one offense, list (up to five) major off charged, ding to ity of offense.

11. ATTORNEY'S NAME (First Name, M.|., Last Name, including any suffix),
JAND MAILING ADDRESS: 13. COURT ORDER:

Name: lHaylham Faraj

Prior Attorney's Name Appointment Dates
Address:  |2181 Jamieson Ave. .
Sulto 1505 D Because the above-named person represented has testified under oath or has
Aloxandria, Virginia 22314 otherwise satisfied this Court that he or she (1 )' is financially unable to
employee counsel and (2) does not wish to waive counsel, and because the
Phone: |ess-970-0005 interests of justice so require, the attorney whose name appears in ltem 12 is
appointed to represent this person in the case OR
E-mail: |haytham@puckettfaraj.com
13. NAME AND ADDRESS OF LAW FIRM El Other (See Instructions)

(Only provide per instructions)

Signature of presiding Judicial Officer or By Order of the Court

Iname:  [Haytham Faraj

Address:  ]2181 Jamieson Ave. Date of Order Nunc¢ Pro Tunc Date
Suite 1505
Alexandria, Virginia 22314

Repayment or partial repayment ordered from the person represented for this service at time of

appointment. Yes O No
- Cl — DURT.USEONL
wours [ 'AOWSTED | ADWSTMENT | ADDITIONAL
Categories (Attach itemization of services with dates) | CLAIMED | . | TOTAL AMOUNT CLAIMED HOURS AMOUNT REVIEW
15. a. Arraignment and/or Plea [ - — — . -
b. Bail and Detention Hearings - ! - - -
c. Motion Hearings 1.5 ! 187.50 - 187.50
- d. Trial - - - -
3 e. Sentencing Hearings . : - - -
g {. Revocation Hearings . ; - - -
- E Appeals Court - : . - -
E er (Specily on addi sheets) 8.3 | | 1.037.50 - 1,037.50
(Rate/Hour $ 12500 TOTALS 9.8 | ) 1,225.00 . 1,225.00
16. a. Interviews and Conferences 46 | ] 575.00 - 575.00
€ b. Obtaining and reviewing records 40| E 500.00 - 500.00
o ¢. Legal Research and brief writing 303 | o E 3,787.50 - 3.787.50
© d. Travel time ] 437.50 - 437.50
© [ e Tnvesligaive & other work (Specily orf 94| i 1.175.00 - 1.175.00
8 (Rate/Hour=§ $§ 125.00 51.8] 6,475.00 - 6,475.00
17. Travel Expenses (lodging, meals, mileage, etc.) P - | N -
18. Other Expenses (other than expent, transcripls, etc. . o 2,14897 | ; 2,148.97
GRAND TOTALS (CLAIMED/AND/ADJUSTED); | =~ 984897 | - 9,848.97
19. CERTIFICATION OF ATTORNEY/PAYEE FOR THE PERIOD OF SERVICE 20. APPOINTMENT TERMINATION 21. CASE DISPOSITION
From: to: DATE IF OTHER THAN
CASE COMPLETION:
- CLAIM STATUS: O Final Payment @ Interim Payment Number 3 O supplemental Payment
(Payment #)
H i i j ]
,9:::, f:: :;::az:sz ',:l:';:-’p to the court for compensation and/or o Yes © No If yes, were you paid? @ Yes O No
0f om coun, ve you, or to your g6 anyone also, roecomv paymant {compensaton or anyfﬁ.'ng b
value} from any other in jon with this representation? Yes @ No Hyes, give details on additional sheets.
swear or affirm the truth or correctness of the above statoments,
Signature of Attorney  /S/ — Da_te
o Tl U APR ' FORPAYMEN1= "USE i et T
23. IN COURT COMP. 24. OUT OF COURT COMP  |25. TRAVEL EXPENSES 26. OTHER EXPENSES 27. TOTAL AMT. APPRJ/CERT.
1,225.00 6,475.00 - 2,148.97 9.848.97
28. SIGNATURE OF THE PRESIDING JUDICIAL OFFICER DATE 28a, JUDGE CODE
29. IN COURT COMP., 30. OUT OF COURT COMP  |31. TRAVEL EXPENSES 32. OTHER EXPENSES 33. TOTAL AMT. APPR/CERT.
1,225.00 6,475.00 - 2,148.97 9,848.97
34. SIGNATURE OF THE CHIEF JUDGE, COURT OF APPEALS (OR DELEGATE) DATE 34a. JUDGE CODE




EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN
STAGE 1 MEGA CASE (PRE-TRIAL)
CASE MANAGEMENT AND BUDGET FORM

Case Number: »Iuow.ns.»ou:
Case Name: USA v. Homama
Lead Counsol:  Haytham Faraj

Hours for Lead Counsal Hours for Associate Proposed Approved Expended
Activities Propoted | Approved | CourtAd). p Proposed \pproved | Court Ad). Expended 1,000.00 1,000.00 2.191.62
Araignment and or Plea (15a) - - - . - - - - [Travel Exp. 773.00 773.00 5.50
IBail and Dotention Hearings (15b) . R R
|Motion Hearings (15¢) 320 32.0 - 1.5
fTuat 0150) - : : : - - - : Summary of Attorney Hours
[Sentencing Hearings (156) . . . . . B . .
|Revocation Hearings (150 . - - . . . . - Attorney Approved Expended |Remaining
{Appeals Court (15g) - - - - - - - - Lead 315.00 182.40 132.60
Othor {15h) 5.0 5.0 - 10.0 . - - - Associate - - -
Interviows and Conferences (16a) 60.0 60.0 B 1.7 - - - - Totals 315.00 182.40 132.60
Obtaining and Reviewing Records (16b) 60.0 60.0 - 8.1
Legal Research and Brief Writing (16¢) 80.0 80.0 - 113.3
Investigative and Other Work (16a) 400 a00 . 273
Amendments to Budget (16¢) 20 20 . 20 . . . . Total Case Budget
Travel (16d) 36.0 36.0 - 8.5 - - - - Preposed Approved Expended
Total Hours 3150 315.0 - 182.4 . - - - 66.248.00 66.248.00 24,897.12
Total Cost (Savings) 39.375.00 39.375.00 . 22,800 00

For expens, expended hours are updated by court personnel when the veuchers are received. Tolals should be cumulalive.

Hat Number of Hours ~ Expenses TOTAL BUDGET
_. EXPERT TYPE _Hato_ ber of Hours_ Expenoe® o L
Ibrahim Al-Marashi (expert on Iraqi intellig 150.00 50.00 2,500.00 - 10.000 10,000
Mahd Khatib 50.00 162.00 . 8.100 8.100
Legal Arts_(ltigation assistance company 100.00 70.00 - 7,000 7,000
TOTALS 282.00 - 2,500.00 - 25,100 25,100

Admin.
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e UPS Stere - #5810

12211 Michigan Ave

rearborn, MI 48124
(313) 792-8610

15/28/10 (01:40 PM

he one stop for all your
postal and business needs.

all the services you need
p your business going.

T

(003) Tt ¢ 9.00

Q1Y 180

t Price $ 0.05

Sublotal ¢ 9.00
K2ServiceGroup (T1) § 0.54
Total ¢§ 9.54
American Express $§  9.54
JeR * *t*********ZO]Z

32763883061205888387 180 Items
Tran: 6243 Reg: 002

i for visiting our store.

AMANO

Financial District Garage

730 Stelby Street, Detroit, Ml 48276

(313)_963_1187

Fet: Computes Number:
Cashiier:

v atisact Lo Humber :
Friteid:

fxited:

Fcke! abib03

Rate:

Total fee:

Cach:

Thank von

)

PEACH 1D #2

23

06701710 12:2}
06701710 16:04
Dispenser #4
NON DIME RATE
$18.00

$18.00

that was easy.

Low prices. Every item. Every day.
23035 Quter Drive
Allen Park, MI 48101
(313) 563-3537

SALE 1522528 3 001 85262
1608 05/29/10 12:21
QTY SKU PRICE

1 HEAVY DUTY VIEW BI

077711797932 13.99
1 DURABLE VIEW BINDE

077711170421 10.99
1 LEGAL INDEX A-I WH

7181031246843 6.29
1 LEGAL INDEX A-Z WH

718103124843 6.29
SUBTOTAL 37.56

Standard Tax 6.00% 2.25
TOTAL $39.81
American Express 39.:

Card No.:
Auth No.:

XXXXXXXXXXX2012 [S]
611102

TSV A

Hamama.

£oOsrco

590

P IVONTO

13700 MIDDUEBILT ROAD
LIVONIA, MI 48150
HEMBER  #111¢87170912 1IN

311803 3*BINDER 2PK 11.49 A
222522 2*BINDER 4PK 10.99 A
91125 1"BINDER 6PK 8.79 A
142010 STORPRE B 16.99 A
A 6. oornx RATL 2.9
TOTA IR
VF nmerl.an Expre 51.16
XXXXXXXXXXXZOIZ aUIPED
06/29/10 14:01
Se4qi: 000730 fippt: 599610
fmericen Exepress Resp: AR

Tran 1D%: 018037356000
Merchant ID 99039011

APPROVED - PURCHASE
AMOUNT: $51.16

0330 201 0000000201 0079

CHANGE .00
10TAL NUMBER OF ITEMS S0.D - 4
CASHIER: SCO LANE & REG# 201
[ 6725720 | L HE 039020] 0079 201

Thonk Youw!
P9ease Come Again!

HHHHINHIIHNHHHHNNKN
THANK YOU

r Using COSTCOx

‘elf Checkout *
1270272720 YETRYEVEVAVEVE "2 4



|Dr. Ibrahim Al-Marashi Work on U.S. v Hamama
Date Description Hours Rate  |Total Remarks
‘ Tolecen w/Aticrney Ro: Case 0.3 $160.00 $45.00)
Rogearch on IS 2 5150.00 $300.00
Telecon w/Altornoy Assisiant Re: Sinius_[0.5 $150.00 $45.00
Research on lIS/Review of Documents/ |11 $150.00 $1,650.00

Totols Duoe to Dr, Al-Marashi 13.6

//SIGNED/}

Dr. fbrahim Al-Marashi

Assoclate Dean of International Relations

Assistant Professor of Communication History & Policy
1E School of Communication, IE University

Campus de Santa Cruz fa Real

Cardenal Zafilga, 12

40003 Segovia, Spain

Mobile +34 663 664 122

Email: ibrahim.almarashi@ic.edu

1€ University Website: http://wwwv.le.edu/university/index.php

$150.00 $2,040.00
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